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VETERINARY REPORT FOR ‘ROCK PRODIGY’ 

 
Signalment: 5-Year-Old Bay Thoroughbred Gelding -985125000063814  

Trainer: A & E Cummings 

Spelling@: Princes Farm   

Veterinarian: Dr Gary Baitz BVSc –Thank you for referring this case 

 
On the 2nd of January 2018, ‘Rock Prodigy’ was referred to Randwick Equine Centre for 
assessment and surgical correction of a throat abnormality recognised as an ‘epiglottic 
entrapment’.  Epiglottic entrapment represents a fold of membrane that becomes entrapped over 
the front of the larynx which reduces the airway size and causes abnormal airflow when exercising 
affecting performance. Pre-operative video-endoscopic examination revealed an uncomplicated 
entrapped fold likely to cause significant airway obstruction.  
 
On the 3rd of January 2018, ‘Rock Prodigy’ was anaesthetised and the intermittent entrapping 
fold was surgically released (axial division with hooked bistoury) by dividing the fold under video-
endoscopic guidance.  A good result from the surgery was achieved and he recovered well from 
general anaesthesia. Video-endoscopic examination the following day showed the epiglottis to be 
un-entrapped and of normal appearance. He has been treated post-surgery with procaine 
penicillin, gentamycin, throat spray, phenylbutazone and dexamethasone. 
 
 

  
Pre-operative image (left) and post-operative image (right) showing the epiglottis un-entrapped. 
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‘Rock Prodigy’ 

 
Aftercare recommendations for ‘Rock Prodigy’ include: 
 

 Stall rest and hand walking for two (2) weeks. After this time he may be turned out in a small 
yard for a further two (2) weeks.  

 

 2g (10mls) oral phenylbutazone once daily for five (5) days. 
 

 Give Bromotrimidine antibiotic (2.5 scoops in feed twice daily) for seven (7) days. 
 

 Anti-inflammatory throat spray – give 10ml morning and night for five (5) more days. Please 
use the catheter provided by passing it along the floor of the nasal passage to 30cm from the 
tip of the catheter, inject 10ml of throat spray solution and then elevate his head to prevent it 
running out the nose. He tolerates this treatment well, but you may need to twitch him to assist 
passing the catheter. Please call if you need further instruction on administration 

 

 Repeat endoscopy in 2 and 4 weeks’ time. If fold swelling has resolved, training may then 
resume. 

  

 Temperature should be taken twice daily for the first week.  If there is any increase in 
temperature (above 38.50 C), dullness of demeanour, loss of appetite or development of a 
cough or nasal discharge, please call. 

 
Uncommon, though potential complications include intermittent dorsal displacement of the palate, 
slow resolution of the swelling and or re-entrapment.  The prognosis for return to racing following 
treatment for this condition is considered very good.  
 
Please call should you have any questions regarding this report. 
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